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Medical Ventilator Market Highlights

The demand for life-extending medical devices isincreasing considerably, which has enabled further
development of medical ventilators as well. Marketreports associated with the medical device industry
have been made available by Market ResearchFuture which creates reports on other industryverticals
that outline the current market scenarios.The medical ventilator market size was valued atUSD 3.10
billion in 2022 and is projected to growfrom USD 3.23 Billion in 2023 to USD 4.4 billion by2032,
exhibiting a compound annual growth rate(CAGR) of 4.9% during the forecast period (2023 –2032) as
per a new Market Research Future report.

The development of medically advanced facilitiesglobally has also prompted a significant demand
spike for medical ventilator market. The existence ofsignificant players in the market is also modifying
theproduct range that is available for use by end users.The escalation in the incidence of chronic
diseasesis expected to enhance the growth of the market inthe forecast period.

Medical Ventilator Market Segmentation

The medical ventilator market report has beensegmented based on types of ventilators,applications,
and regions. The segmentation on thetypes of ventilators comprises of invasive ventilators,non-
invasive ventilators, and portable mechanicalventilators. The non-invasive ventilators areadditionally
segmented into pressure-cycled, volume-cycled, flow-cycled, and time-cycled ventilators. The
mechanical ventilators are additionally divided into negative pressure and positive pressureventilators.
Based on applications, the medical ventilator marketis segmented into neonatal care,critical care,
emergency care, and others. The regions reviewedin the market are Asia Pacific, NorthAmerica,
Africa,Europe, and the Middle East.

Medical Ventilator Market Players

The major competitors shaping the overall marketexpansion of medical ventilators are Koninklijke
Philips N.V. (the Netherlands), Medtronic (Ireland), ResMed (U.S.), General Electric Company (U.S.),
Allied Healthcare Products Inc. (U.S), Becton, Dickinson and Company (U.S.), Hamilton Medical
(Switzerland) and Teleflex Incorporated (U.S.) among others.

Medical Ventilator Market Regional Analysis

The Asia Pacific region is displaying the top growth level in this market owing to the commonness of
chronic heart diseases & respiratory illnesses and the rise in environmental pollution that has created
a large patient pool to drive the expansion of this market. Moreover, the demand for point-of-care
administration, increase in surgical procedure and the demand for non-invasive ventilators drive this
market in Asia Pacific. The market demonstrates a stable but intensifying growth in the Middle East
and African regions owing to the occurrence of obesity, heart disease, and other chronic illness, and
escalating number of surgical procedures being carried out in hospitals.

The Americas region is the leading market for medical ventilators due to a boost in lifestyle diseases
resulting in chronic obstructive pulmonary diseases, asthma, bronchitis & other disorders. Moreover,
the rise in surgical procedures, a growing number of critically ill patients, as well as the existence of a
huge number of medical device manufacturers in the U.S is enhancing the development of themarket.
Furthermore, the addiction to smoking is also contributing to the development of this market.The
European region is the next principal market whose expansion is credited to the escalatingprevalence
of chronic respiratory diseases and the subsequent demand for mechanical ventilators.The
development of healthcare infrastructure, accessibility to funds from the government and the demand
for critical care devices will also add to the growth of this market in the European region.

About Market Research Future:

At Market Research Future (MRFR), we enable our customers to unravel the complexity of various
industries through our Cooked Research Report (CRR), Half-Cooked Research Reports (HCRR), &
Consulting Services. MRFR team have supreme objective to provide the optimum quality market
research and intelligence services to our clients.

Contact us:

Market Research Future (part of Wantstats Research and Media Private Limited),

99 Hudson Street, 5Th Floor,

New York, New York 10013

United States of America

+1 628 258 0071

Email: sales@marketresearchfuture.com
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