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culture exchange outline
culture exchange outline. Hana arrives, a slender and somewhat timid blond dickgirl in shorts and 
babydoll tee, description and mention strange selection process. Fasti is large and sexually imposing, 
capable of telepathic influence almost immediately making the girl feel horny and attracted to the 
anthro, which confuses her as she has never felt that way before. Fasti starts taking her on a tour 
of the house with more and more forward touching of Hana’s body, musk and mental tricks causing 
her to grow horny and sweat, her shorts feeling quickly tight and uncomfortable with how hard and 
needy her cock suddenly feels. 

Fasti notices after showing off her personal bedroom with a stronger blast of that scent, then suggests 
stripping down “to beat the heat” She begins to remove Hana’s clothes but when she protests the 
feline strips down to her underwear as a show of good faith, revealing even more of her body and 
exposing the girl to an even stronger dose of the lulling, arousal inducing musk she creates. This lets 
Fasti mentally erode the girl’s prudishness enough to have her agree and then voice her excitement to 
her embarrassment while allowing Fasti to strip her and even brazenly sneak a few feels of the lithe 
shemale’s body.

The conversation switches to talk of bodies and sex, establishing some rules made to be broken 
before slowly verbally and mentally coaxing the girl into rubbing one out inside her panties while 
watching Fasti jack off until she sprays them both down with a wild and insane amount of cum. Hana 
has a toe curling orgasm to this feeling thanks to Fasti’s influence, then the feline quickly excuses 
herself for a shower after peeling out of her clothes and wiping up her share of her cum, leaving the 
soaked and slimy underwear behind. 

Hana has a bit more agency with the daunting feline’s absence and decides to bathe but doesn’t 
make it out of the living room before Fasti’s renewed influence goads her into picking up the used 
underwear dripping and potent with Fasti’s juices and smear herself from face to thighs with the 
creamy, silky cum and jerking herself into soreness. After a steamy and sensual bath imagining Fasti 
naked and bathing too she collapses into bed and has a vivid and steamy dream of Fasti fucking her 
and cumming on her for hours. When she awakes she finds she has cum in her panties so much she 
can feel them soaked against her backside. While imagining it was Fasti’s cum she rubs herself off 
twice, then takes off her undies and wipes them off on her face, fingering her mouth lewdly while 
jerking off again, then regains her senses enough to get dressed in a revealing outfit of sleep shorts 
and a tied button down blouse and catch Fasti lounging on the large couch topless and in tight briefs. 

They talk about what just happened, though Hana doesn’t mention her masturbation spree and neither 
acknowledge stealing the underwear. Fasti reassures Hana and draws her into a conspiracy by 
making her promise she won’t report this to the cultural exchange office. It’ll just be our secret. Hana 
giggles in her hazed way and squirms on her feet, drawing even closer while Fasti’s laser locked gaze 
on her tented crotch. Hana consents by whipping her cock out and Fasti promptly sucks her down 
onto the couch and then grapples her before orally milking her of at least five mentally enhanced, eye-
crossing and overstimulating climaxes while fingering her ass, then guides her well mindfucked puppet 
to a lengthy and sloppy worship of her large cock. After a few hours of being frosted and mouthing that 
bestial girth Hana is coerced and forced to admit that she enjoys it more than she expected, then she 
continues until they both can’t stay awake, pausing only so Fasti can blow her again and again. 

This begins Hana’s training for the next week, waking to a morning bout of more aggressive oral 
milking by Fasti while also training her anally for larger insertions, then the morning is spent 
worshiping Fasti’s cock while masturbating herself and rubbing cum from them both all over her body. 
They break for lunch but quickly go back to a repeat performance that lasts until the evening and then 
Hana is sent to bathe and bed down where she is coerced to masturbate herself into sore exhaustion. 
Hana’s dreams grow more vivid and lewd with each passing day. She eventually starts to lose track of 
which acts are dreams and which are real. By the end of a week Hana’s breasts have gone up a cup 
size and her cock has gained inches and girth, plus she’s capable of making much more cum. 
Mentally she’s constantly horny and will feel anxious if Fasti isn’t actively using her body for pleasure 
for more than five minutes. They both wear little more than underwear between their lewd sessions.  

Fasti announces that she believes Hana is ready to take Fasti’s cock. The initial preparation and lead 
up to a difficult insertion is tender and gentle, but once Fasti is able to slip inside Hana’s ass she 
instantly becomes more aggressive, quickly beginning to rail Hana’s virgin asshole and mentally 
bombarding her until she is properly broken, then mentally reprogramming the young dickgirl to 
behave like a sex obsessed size queen. This solidifies over hours of Fasti fucking Hana’s ass, then 
they wind down with more cock worship and milking before Fasti invites Hana to share her bed for the 
night.

Swimming in a sea of musky  Fasti scent Hana tries to sleep but is mysteriously woken every hour 
with the obsessive impulse to taste Fasti’s cum and jerk off with it. When Fasti is awoken by her new 
toy’s attentions she grapples her and then fucks her to sleep. 

Hana wakes with Fasti still hard inside her ass and cums with the realization, then procedes to fuck 
herself and masturbate until Fasti wakes and rails her, filling her to overflowing with cum. 

Following the cleanup of their session, sharing a shower with Hana worshipping Fasti as they bathe, 
Fasti gifts the girl with a black, silk choker and explains she is never to take it off unless told to, 
especially in crowds.

Hana quickly grows excited as Fasti then gets them ready to go out, making her wear a tied top and 
tight shorts. Hana starts to feel horny and needy the instant they leave the house, but she’s instructed 
to keep her teasing to a minimum and is left squirming as they walk and then ride a few minute’s 
distance to a different part of town. 

Upon entering the dimly lit club Hana notices how all of the other large anthro patrons are looking at 
her, finding it exciting, but she clings to Fasti as they are delivered to a booth with two other large 
canine anthros that also drool over Hana, sharing lewd pleasantries with the feline as they get seated. 

Hana then notices that between the two canines, almost hidden by their imposing and muscular 
bodies, is another human, tan skinned and dark haired, wearing a similar outfit and matching collar as 
hers. As they lock eyes Hana can tell that this girl is horny too, probably even more than her if that’s 
possible, and it makes her heart race to think they could have fun together. 
The other girl starts to rub Hana’s legs with her feet, eventually grinding at her trapped cock through 
her shorts as Hana plays footsy back and discovers the girl also has a cock.

They are caught by their respective anthro’s and teased until Fasti suggests that they both fuck there 
on the table. Hana becomes self-concious but the other girl is already eagerly climbing up on it toward 
her and makes all doubt fade away with a deep kiss before pulling her up too.  
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